
Public Notice
NOTICE OF MEETING OF THE 
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF 
GRUNDY COUNTY, STATE OF 
IOWA, ON THE MATTER OF THE 
PROPOSED ISSUANCE OF NOT 
TO EXCEED $4,500,000 GEN-
ERAL OBLIGATION BONDS OF 
THE COUNTY (FOR ESSENTIAL 
COUNTY PURPOSES), AND THE 
HEARING ON THE ISSUANCE 
THEREOF
	 PUBLIC NOTICE is hereby giv-
en that the Board of Supervisors of 
Grundy County, State of Iowa, will 
hold a public hearing on the 16th 
day of February, 2021, at 9:00 A.M., 
in the Grundy County Engineer’s 
Office, 22580 M Ave., Grundy 
Center, Iowa, at which meeting the 
Board proposes to take addition-
al action for the issuance of not to 
exceed $4,500,000 General Obli-
gation Bonds, for essential county 
purposes, to provide funds to pay 
the costs of capital projects for the 
construction, reconstruction, im-
provement, repair or equipping of 
bridges, roads, and culverts which 
assist in economic development 
through the creation of jobs and 
wealth, including Grundy Road.
	 At the above meeting the Board 
shall receive oral or written objec-
tions from any resident or property 
owner of the County to the above 
action. After all objections have 
been received and considered, the 
Board will at the meeting or at any 
adjournment thereof, take addition-
al action for the issuance of the 
Bonds or will abandon the proposal 
to issue said Bonds.
	 This notice is given by order of 
the Board of Supervisors of Grundy 
County, State of Iowa, as provided 
by Section 331.443 of the Code of 
Iowa.
	 Dated this 1st day of February, 
2021.
	 Rhonda R. Deters
	 County Auditor, Grundy County
	 State of Iowa
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